
IIITB Invites Applications For The Post Of Research Outreach Associate     

(Last Date For Receipt Of Application Is July 20, 2023) 

Designation Research Outreach Associate 

Job 
Description 

 Network/liaison with the industry; public and private 
corporations, government institutions, research institutions, 
venture capitalists and other academic institutions and focus 
on securing consultancy and research projects with them. 

 Leverage the institute’s research strengths to enable a 
differentiated and impactful collaboration model with external 
organizations - Bring in more 
market/research/technology/social challenges from 
corporates and conduct workshops and hackathons to 
elaborate on such challenges.   

 Obtain Industry sponsor / CSR sponsor for research 
activities.  

 Maintain close relations with the industry and act as a liaison 
to promote industrial collaborations with institutions involving 
active and mutually beneficial R & D projects 

 Conduct executive briefings for corporate leaders about the 
matters relating to emerging technology and social 
innovation with particular emphasis on institute’s core 
research areas.  

 Showcase IIITB’s research and innovation contribution in 
prestigious state and national events.  

 Foster academic relationships with other reputed academic 
and research institutions, government agencies, non-
governmental organizations, corporations, etc. both in India 
and abroad 

 Showcase ongoing research through writing and editing 
articles or short summaries for diverse audience 

Qualifications, 
Experience 
and Skills 
needed 

 M.Tech / MBA from a recognized university 

 Experience of working with a research institute/body 

 Proven and excellent written and verbal communications 
skills  

 Minimum 3-5 years of experience 

 Ability to work independently as well as in a team 

Pay and 
Allowances 

As per norms of the institute 

Last date for 
applications 

Interested candidates are requested to fill in the form below along 
with resume latest by July 20, 2023 
 
https://forms.gle/iPEBdxXT9EuVwTTcA 

 


